
454 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 
 

V.   NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 
 

 
1.  Chesapeake and Ohio Canal 

 
100 STAT. 1144 PUBLIC LAW 99–456—OCT. 8, 1986 
 
 Public Law 99–456 

99th Congress 
An Act 

 
Oct. 8, 1986 

[S. 1766] 
To designate the Cumberland terminus of the Chesapeake and Ohio Canal 

National Historical Park in honor of J. Glenn Beall, Sr. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Appropriation 
authorization. 

 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, That (a) the 
Cumberland terminus of the Chesapeake and Ohio Canal National 
Historical Park is hereby dedicated to J. Glenn Beall, Sr. in grateful 
recognition of his outstanding efforts to preserve and protect the 
canal and towpath from development. 
 (b) In order to carry out the provisions of this Act, the Secretary 
of the Interior is authorized and directed to provide such 
identification by signs, including changes in existing signs, 
materials, maps, markers, or other means as will appropriately 
inform the public of the contributions of J. Glenn Beall, Sr. 
 (c) The Secretary of the Interior is further authorized and 
directed to cause to be erected and maintained, within the exterior 
boundaries of the Cumberland terminus of the Chesapeake and Ohio 
Canal National Historical Park, an appropriate memorial to J. Glenn 
Beall, Sr. Such memorial shall be of such design and be located at 
such place as the Secretary shall determine. 
 (d) There are authorized to be appropriated up to $25,000 to carry 
out the purposes of this Act. 
 
 Approved October 8, 1986. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—S. 1766: 

SENATE REPORTS: No. 99–340 (Comm. on Energy and Natural Resources). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 132 (1986): 

Aug. 1, considered and passed Senate. 
Sept. 24, considered and passed House. 

 
 
 
 

 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 455 
 

PUBLIC LAW 101–320—JULY 3, 1990 104 STAT. 292 
 
Public Law 101–320 
101st Congress 

An Act 
 

 

July 3, 1990 To amend the Chesapeake and Ohio Canal Development Act to make certain 
changes relating to the Chesapeake and Ohio Canal National Historical Park 
Commission. 

 
   Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, 
 
SECTION 1. CHESAPEAKE AND OHIO CANAL NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARK 

COMMISSION. 
 
 (a) VACANCY.—Section 6(c) of the Chesapeake and Ohio Canal 
Development Act (16 U.S.C. 410y–4(c)) is amended by adding at the 
end the following: “A member may serve after the expiration of his 
term until his successor has taken office.”. 
 (b) TERMINATION.—Section 6(g) of such Act (16 U.S.C. 410y–4(g)) 
is amended by striking “twenty” and inserting “thirty”. 
 
 Approved July 3, 1990. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 3545: 
HOUSE REPORTS: No. 101–456 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
SENATE REPORTS: No. 101–312 (Comm. on Energy and Natural Resources). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 136 (1990): 

Apr. 24, considered and passed House. 
June 14, considered and passed Senate. 

 
 

[H.R. 3545]  
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



456 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 
 

2.    Colonial 
 
 

100 STAT. 831 PUBLIC LAW 99–390—AUG. 23, 1986 
 
 Public Law 99–390 

99th Congress 
An Act 

 
Aug. 23, 1986 
[H.R. 3556] 

To provide for the exchange of land for the Cape Henry Memorial cite in Fort 
Story, Virginia. 

 
 
 
National parks, 
monuments, etc. 
Colonial 
National 
Historical Park, 
VA. 
16 USC 81o. 

   Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, That the Secretary 
of the Interior may transfer administrative jurisdiction over 
approximately 0.23 acres of land within Colonial National Historical 
Park, Virginia, to the Secretary of the Army, and in exchange 
therefor, he may accept administrative jurisdiction over a like 
amount of land from the Secretary of the Army, transfer of which is 
hereby authorized, for the purpose of relocating the Cape Henry 
Memorial Cross. Land over which jurisdiction is transferred to the 
Secretary of the Interior shall become part of Colonial National 
Historical Park, and land over which jurisdiction is transferred to 
the Secretary of the Army shall become part of Fort Story Military 
Reservation. 
 
 Approved August 23, 1986. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 3556: 

HOUSE REPORTS: No. 99–442, Pt. 1 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
SENATE REPORTS: No. 99–365 (Comm. on Energy and Natural Resources). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 132 (1986): 

Mar. 11, considered and passed House. 
Aug. 11, considered and passed Senate. 

 
 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 457 
 

PUBLIC LAW 101–573—NOV. 15, 1990 104 STAT. 2812 
 
Public Law 101–573 
101st Congress 

An Act 
 

 

Nov. 15, 1990 To authorize the Secretary of the Interior to permit certain uses of lands within 
the Colonial National Historical Park in the Commonwealth of Virginia. 

 
[H.R. 4107] 

 
 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled,  
 
SECTION 1. RIGHT-OF-WAY FOR NATURAL GAS PIPELINE. 
 
 The Secretary of the Interior is authorized, under regulations 
generally applicable to utility rights-of-way in the National Park 
System, to issue a permit to the Virginia Natural Gas Company 
granting an underground easement for the construction, operation, 
and maintenance of one natural gas transmission pipeline under and 
across the Colonial National Historical Park in the State of Virginia. 
The natural gas pipeline shall be located within the Virginia Power 
Company’s existing electric transmission corridor located between 
Routes 143 and 716. 
 
SEC. 2. RIGHTS-OF-WAY FOR EXISTING PIPELINES. 
 
 The Secretary of the Interior is authorized, under regulations 
generally applicable to utility rights-of-way in the National Park 
System, to issue permits granting underground easements for the 
operation and maintenance of the following existing pipeline facilities 
under and across the Colonial National Historical Park in the State 
of Virginia: 

 (1) Colonial Products petroleum pipeline numbered LOA–90–
001. 
 (2) Virginia Natural Gas pipeline at the Glass House 
numbered LOA–90–002B. 

   (3) Virginia Natural Gas pipeline at Page Street numbered  
   LOA–90–002C. 

 (4) Virginia Natural Gas pipeline at Route 143 numbered 
 LOA–90–002D. 

 
  Approved November 15, 1990.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 4107: 
HOUSE REPORT: No. 101–706 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 136 (1990): 
 Sept. 17, considered and passed House. 
 Oct. 27, considered and passed Senate. 
  

 

 
 
 
 
Virginia 
Natural Gas 
Company. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
104 STAT. 2813 

 



458 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 
 

3. Cumberland Gap 
 

101 STAT. 132 PUBLIC LAW 100–17—APR. 2, 1987 
 
 Public Law 100–17 

100th Congress 
An Act 

 
Apr. 2, 1987 

[H.R. 2] 
To authorize funds for construction of highways, for highway safety programs,  
    and for mass transportation programs, to expand and improve the relocation 
    assistance program, and for other purposes. 

 
 
Surface 
Transportation 
and Uniform 
Relocation 
Assistance Act of 
1987. 
 
 
 
101 STAT. 134 
Federal-Aid 
Highway Act of 
1987. 
 
101 STAT. 205 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
101 STAT.  261 

 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, 
 
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS. 
 

(a) SHORT TITLE.—This Act may be cited as the “Surface 
  Transportation and Uniform Relocation Assistance Act of 1987”. 
 

*            *            *            *            *            *            * 
TITLE I—FEDERAL-AID HIGHWAY ACT 1987 

 
*            *            *            *            *            *            * 

 
SEC. 150. CUMBERLAND GAP NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARK, VIRGINIA. 
 
 (a) AVAILABILITY OF PARKWAY FUNDS.—Section 160(a) of the 
Federal-Aid Highway Act of 1973 (87 Stat. 278) is amended by 
adding at the end the following new sentences: “After completion of 
the reconstruction and relocation of Route 25E through the 
Cumberland Gap National Historical Park (including construction 
of a tunnel and the approaches thereto), funds available for 
parkways, notwithstanding the definition of parkways in section 
101(a) of title 23, United States Code, shall be available to finance 
the cost of upgrading from 2 lanes to 4 lanes a highway providing 
access from such route through that portion of the Cumberland Gap 
National Historical Park which lies within the State of Virginia. 
The project referred to in the preceding sentence, including 
preparation of any environmental impact statements with respect 
to such project, shall not delay or affect in any way the 
reconstruction and relocation of Route 25E (including construction 
of a tunnel and approaches thereto).”. 
 (b) INCLUSION OF APPROACHES.—Subsection (b) of section 160 of 
such Act is amended by inserting after “rights-of-way” the following: 
“, including approaches in the State of Virginia,”. 

*            *            *            *            *            *            * 
     
LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 2 (S. 387): 
HOUSE REPORTS: No. 100–27 (Comm. of Conference). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 133 (1987): 

Jan. 21, considered and passed House. 
Feb. 4, considered and passed Senate, amended, in lieu of S. 387. 
Feb. 19, House disagreed to Senate amendments. 
Mar. 18, House agreed to conference report. 
Mar. 19, Senate agreed to conference report. 

WEEKLY COMPILATION OF PRESIDENTIAL DOCUMENTS, Vol. 23 (1987): 
Mar. 27, Presidential veto messages. 

CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 133 (1987): 
Mar. 31, House overrode veto. 
Apr. 2, Senate overrode veto. 

 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 459 
 

4. Harpers Ferry 
 

PUBLIC LAW 99–192—DEC. 19, 1985 99 STAT. 1329 
 
Public Law 99–192 
99th Congress 

An Act 
 

 

Dec. 19, 1985 To designate the pedestrian walkway crossing the Potomac River at Harpers 
Ferry National Historical Park as the “Goodloe E. Byron Memorial Pedestrian 
Walkway”. 

 

[H.R. 3735] 

 
 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, That the pedestrian 
walkway located in Washington County in the State of Maryland, 
and Jefferson County in the State of West Virginia, which crosses 
the Potomac River at Harpers Ferry National Historical Park, and 
which is situated in part on the structure which is cantilevered onto 
the bridge owned by the Baltimore and Ohio Railroad Company 
(identified as the Bridge Numbered Zero of the Shenandoah 
Subdivision) and in part on the trestle of such bridge, shall hereafter 
be known and designated as the “Goodloe E. Byron Memorial 
Pedestrian Walkway”. 
 SEC. 2. Any reference in any law, map, regulation, document, 
record, or other paper of the United States to the pedestrian 
walkway referred to in the first section of this Act shall be deemed to 
be a reference to the “Goodloe E. Byron Memorial Pedestrian 
Walkway”. 
 
 Approved December 19, 1985. 
 

 
Maryland. 
West Virginia. 
Public buildings 
and grounds. 
Bridges. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
   
LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H. R. 3735: 
HOUSE REPORT No. 99–412 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 131 (1985): 

Dec. 6, considered and passed House.  
Dec. 11, considered and passed Senate. 

 

 

 
 



460 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 
 
103 STAT. 681 PUBLIC LAW 101–109—OCT. 6, 1989 
 
 Public Law 101–109 

101st Congress 
An Act 

 
Oct. 6, 1989 

[S. 85] 
To authorize the acceptance of certain lands for addition to Harpers Ferry 

National Historical Park, West Virginia. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Gifts and 
property. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Public 
information. 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 450bb 
note. 

  Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, That (a) the first 
section of the Act entitled “An Act to provide for the establishment of 
the Harpers Ferry National Monument”, approved June 30, 1944 (58 
Stat. 645; 16 U.S.C. 450bb), is amended by— 

(1) striking “two thousand four hundred and seventy-five 
acres” in the fist sentence and inserting “two thousand five 
hundred and five acres”; and 

(2) inserting after the first sentence the following: “The 
Secretary is authorized to acquire, by donation only, 
approximately twenty-seven acres of land or interests therein 
which are outside the boundary of the Harpers Ferry National 
Historical Park and generally depicted on a map entitled 
‘Proposed Bradley and Ruth Nash Addition—Harpers Ferry 
National Historical Park,’ dated April 1, 1989 and numbered 
385–80056. Such map shall be on file and available for public 
inspection in the offices of the National Park Service, 
Department of the Interior, Washington, District of Columbia. 
When acquired, such lands or interests therein shall become a 
part of the park, subject to the laws and regulations applicable 
thereto.”. 

 (b) Nothing in this Act shall be deemed to prohibit the Secretary 
from using such measures as may be necessary to acquire a clear 
and marketable title, free of any and all encumbrances, to the lands 
identified for acquisition in paragraph (a)(2) of this Act. 
 
 Approved October 6, 1989. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—S. 85: 
HOUSE REPORTS: No. 101–250 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
SENATE REPORTS: No. 101–32 (Comm. on Energy and Natural Resources). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 135 (1989): 

July 14, considered and passed Senate. 
      Sept. 25, considered and passed House. 

 
 
 
 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 461 
 

5.   Independence/National Constitution Center 
 

PUBLIC LAW 100–433—SEPT. 16, 1988 102 STAT. 1640 
 
Public Law 100–433 
100th Congress 

An Act 
 

 

Sept. 16, 1988 To provide for continuing interpretation of the Constitution in appropriate units of 
the National Park System by the Secretary of the Interior, and to establish a 
National center for the United States Constitution within the Independence 
National Historical Park in Philadelphia, Pennsylvania. 

 

[H.R. 1939] 

 
 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, 
 
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE. 
 
 This Act may be cited as the “Constitution Heritage Act of 1988”. 
 
SEC. 2. FINDINGS AND PURPOSES. 
 
 (a) FINDINGS.—Congress finds that: 

   (1) 1987 was the bicentennial of the signing of the United   
 States Constitution; 

   (2) commemoration   of   the     Constitution’s      bicentennial 
included  various events conducted by the Federal Commission 

 on the Bicentennial   of   the United  States   Constitution,  and 
 State and local bicentennial commissions; 

   (3) bicentennial   activities   included  important  educational 
 and instructional programs to heighten public awareness of the 
 Constitution and the democratic process; 

   (4) educational       programs   for   the Constitution should   
 continue  after  the    bicentennial    to   document  its profound 
 impact on the political, economic and social development of this 
 Nation, and in order to recognize those Americans instrumen-   
 tal in the history of the Constitution; and 

  (5) units of the National Park System preserve and interpret 
   key  historic sites   that   document   the history  of  he origins, 
 subsequent  development,  and   effects   of  the United   States 
 Constitution on this Nation. 

 (b) PURPOSES.—It is therefore the policy of the Congress to 
provide each of the following: 

   (1) the necessary  resources   to   develop  a national resource 
 center  to    undertake,    on   an  ongoing    basis,    educational 
 programs on the Constitution; 

   (2) exhibits of, and an archives for, programs on or related to 
 the recent bicentennial of  the  United States Constitution; and 

  (3) interpretation of the United  States   Constitution at those 
  units of the National Park System particularly  relevant  to   its 
 history. 

 
SEC. 3. ESTABLISHMENT OF THE CENTER. 
 
 (a) ESTABLISHMENT BY SECRETARY OF THE INTERIOR.—The 
Secretary of the Interior (hereafter in this Act referred to as the 
“Secretary”) shall establish The National Constitution Center 
(hereafter in this Act referred to as the “Center”) within or in close 
proximity to the Independence National Historical Park. The Center 
shall disseminate information about the United States Constitution 
on a non- 
 

 
Constitution 
Heritage Act 
of 1988. 
Conservation. 
Historic 
preservation. 
16 USC 407aa 
note. 
16 USC 407aa. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Education. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 407bb. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Public 
information. 



462 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 

 
102 STAT. 1641 

 
PUBLIC LAW 100–433—SEPT. 16, 1988 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Education. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 407cc. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Grants. 
Contracts. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 407dd. 

 
partisan basis in order to increase the awareness and understanding 
of the Constitution among the American people. 
 (b) FUNCTIONS OF THE CENTER.—The functions of the Center shall 
include— 
     (1) serving as a center of exhibits and related materials on the 

history and contemporary significance of the Constitution; 
(2) directing a national program of public education on the 

Constitution; issuing traveling exhibits, commissioning radio 
and television programs, furnishing materials for the schools, 
and providing other education services; 

(3) functioning as an intellectual center, drawing both 
academics and practitioners to debate and refine constitutional 
issues and, at the same time, providing intellectual support for 
the Center’s exhibits and public education program; and 

(4) creating archives for programs on the bicentennial of the 
United States Constitution. 

 
SEC. 4. ACQUISITION OF SITE FOR AND OPERATION OF THE CENTER. 
 
 (a) PROVIDING A SITE.—The Secretary through the General 
Services Administration, is authorized to provide, upon adequate 
reimbursement, a site, including necessary structures, for the Center 
by— 

(1) using an existing structure or modifying an existing 
structure for use; or 

(2) constructing a new structure to house the Center. The 
Secretary may acquire such land as is necessary to provide a site 
for the Center. 

 (b) PROVISION OF FUNDS TO THE CENTER.—The Secretary is 
authorized to make grants to, and enter into cooperative 
agreements, contracts or leases with the National Constitution 
Center, Philadelphia, Pennsylvania, which shall operate the Center 
as provided in this Act in order to carry out the purposes of this Act. 
Funds authorized to be appropriated under this Act may be made 
available to the National Constitution Center only to the extent that 
they are matched by such entity with funds from nonfederal sources. 
 
SEC. 5. DIRECTIVES TO THE SECRETARY. 
 
 (a) INDEPENDENCE NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARK AND OTHER 
UNITS.—The Secretary shall interpret the origins, subsequent 
development, and effects of the United States Constitution on this 
country at Independence National Historical Park and at such other 
units of the National Park System as are closely associated with the 
Constitution. The Secretary shall select not less than 12 units of the 
National Park System for such interpretation, including 
Independence National Historical Park. 
 (b) MEMORIAL.—The Secretary is authorized to establish and 
maintain at Independence National Historical Park an appropriate 
memorial to the United States Constitution as a key document in 
our Nation’s history. 
 (c) PUBLIC MATERIALS.—In coordination with the National 
Constitution Center, the Secretary shall develop and make available 
to the public interpretive and educational materials related to sites 
within the National Park System as referred to in subsection (a). 
 (d) COOPERATIVE AGREEMENTS.—The Secretary may enter into 
cooperative agreements with the owners or administrators of historic 
sites   closely    associated     with     the    Constitution,  pursuant  to 
 

 
 
 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 463 
 

PUBLIC LAW 100–433—SEPT. 16, 1988 102 STAT. 1642 
 
which the Secretary may provide technical assistance in the 
preservation and interpretation of such sites. 
 (e) RESEARCH AND EDUCATION.—The Secretary shall contract with 
the National Constitution Center and other qualified institutions of 
higher learning for research and other activities including the 
distribution of interpretive and educational materials as appropriate 
in order to carry out the provisions of this Act. 
 (f) Nothing in this section may be construed to alter or waive the 
requirement that the Secretary maintain the historic integrity of 
units of the National Park System, including compliance with 
section 106 of the Historic Preservation Act (90 Stat. 1320) as 
amended. 
 
SEC. 6. FUNDING. 
 
 There are authorized to be appropriated such sums as may be 
necessary to carry out the provisions of this Act. 
 
 Approved September 16, 1988.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 1939: 
 
HOUSE REPORTS: No. 100–107 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
SENATE REPORTS: No. 100–450 (Comm. on Energy and Natural Resources). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD: 

Vol. 133 (1987): May 27, considered and passed House. 
Vol. 134 (1988): Aug. 9, considered and passed Senate, amended. 

Sept. 8, House concurred in Senate amendments. 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
Contracts. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 407ee. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 



464 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 
 

6.   Jean Lafitte 
 

102 STAT. 16 PUBLIC LAW 100–250—FEB. 16, 1988 
 
 Public Law 100–250 

100th Congress 
An Act 

 
Feb. 16, 1988 
[H.R. 2566] 

To amend the National Parks and Recreation Act of 1978, as amended, to extend 
the term of the Delta Region Preservation commission, and for other purposes. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 230. 
 
 
Cultural 
programs. 
16 USC 230a. 
Public lands. 
Gifts and 
property. 
 
 
 
16 USC 230f. 

 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, That title IX of the 
National Parks and Recreation Act of 1978, as amended (16 U.S.C. 
230), is further amended as follows: 
 (a) In section 901 by adding the following new phrase and 
renumbering subsequent phrases accordingly: 

“(4) folk life centers to be established in the Acadian region;”. 
 (b) In section 902 by adding the following new subsection: 
 “(g) The Secretary is authorized to acquire lands or interests in 
lands by donation, purchase with donated or appropriated funds or 
exchange, not to exceed approximately 20 acres, in Acadian villages 
and towns. Any lands so acquired shall be developed, maintained 
and operated as part of the Jean Lafitte National Historical Park.”. 
 (c) In section 907(e) by striking out “ten years” and inserting in 
lieu thereof  “twenty years”. 
 
 Approved February 16, 1988. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 2566: 

HOUSE REPORTS: No. 100–304 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
SENATE REPORTS: No. 100–251 (Comm. on Energy and Natural Resources). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD: 

Vol. 133 (1987): Sept. 29, considered and passed House. 
Dec. 19, considered and passed Senate, amended.  

Vol. 134 (1988): Feb. 2, House concurred in Senate amendment. 
 

 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 465 
 

   7.   Kalaupapa 
 

PUBLIC LAW 100–202—DEC. 22, 1987 101 STAT. 1329 
 
Public Law 100–202 
100th Congress 

Joint Resolution 
 

 

Dec. 22, 1987 Making further continuing appropriations for the fiscal year 1988, and for other 
purposes. 

 
[H.J. Res. 395] 

 Resolved by the Senate and House of Representatives of the United 
States of America in Congress assembled, 

 *            *            *            *            *            *            * 
AN ACT 

 
Making appropriations for the Department of the Interior and Related Agencies 

for the fiscal Year ending September 30, 1988, and for other purposes. 
 

TITLE I—DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR   
 

*            *            *            *            *            *            * 
NATIONAL PARK SERVICE 

 
OPERATION OF THE NATIONAL PARK SYSTEM 

 
*            *            *            *            *            *            * 

. . . Provided further, That notwithstanding any other provision of 
law, Public Law 96–565 is amended by adding the following at the 
end of section 104(a): “The Secretary may lease from the Department 
of Hawaiian Home Lands said trust lands until such time as said 
lands may be acquired by exchange as set forth herein or otherwise 
acquired. The Secretary may enter into such a lease without regard 
to fiscal year limitations.”:  . . .  

*            *            *            *            *            *            *  
   
    Approved December 22, 1987. 
 

Certified April 20, 1988. 
*            *            *            *            *            *            * 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.J. Res. 395: 
 HOUSE REPORTS: No. 100–415 (Comm. on Appropriations) and No. 100–498 

(Comm. of Conference). 
 SENATE REPORTS: No. 100–238 (Comm. on Appropriations). 
 CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 133 (1987): 
   Dec. 3, considered and passed House. 
   Dec. 11, considered and passed Senate, amended. 
   Dec. 21, House and Senate agreed to conference report.  
 WEEKLY COMPILATION OF PRESIDENTIAL DOCUMENTS, Vol. 23 (1987): 

       Dec. 22, Presidential remarks. 
 

 
 
 
 
101 STAT. 
1329-214  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
101 STAT. 
1329-218 
 
 
 
 
101 STAT. 
1329-220 
16 USC 410jj-3.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
101 STAT. 
1329-450 
 
 
 

 



466 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 
 
 

8.   Kaloko-Honokohau 
 

103 STAT. 701 PUBLIC LAW 101–121—OCT.  23, 1989 
 
 Public Law 101–121 

101st Congress 
An Act 

 
Oct. 23, 1989 
[H.R. 2788] 

Making appropriations for the Department of the Interior and related agencies 
for the fiscal year ending September 30, 1990, and for other purposes. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
103 STAT. 706  
 
 
103 STAT. 708 
 
 
16 USC 396f. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
103 STAT. 756 

 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled,  
 

 *            *            *            *            *            *            * 
 

TITLE I—DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR   
 

*            *            *            *            *            *            * 
NATIONAL PARK SERVICE 

 
*            *            *            *            *            *            * 

LAND ACQUISITION AND STATE ASSISTANCE 
 

 *            *            *            *            *            *            * 
. . . Provided further, That section 317 of Public Law 98–146 is 
amended by adding the following: “The land owner may also use the 
credits in exchange for excess lands, wherever located, under the 
jurisdiction of the Secretary of the Interior.”. 
 

*            *            *            *            *            *            * 
 
 Approved October 23, 1989. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 2788: 
HOUSE REPORTS: No. 101–120 (Comm. on Appropriations) and No. 101–264 

(Comm. of Conference). 
SENATE REPORTS: No 101–85 (Comm. on Appropriations). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, VOL. 135 (1989): 
 July 12, considered and passed House. 
 July 26, considered and passed Senate, amended. 
 Oct. 3, House agreed to conference report; receded and concurred in certain 
  Senate amendments, in others with amendments. 
 Oct. 7, Senate agreed to conference report; concurred in House amendments. 
WEEKLY COMPILATION OF PRESIDENTIAL DOCUMENTS, Vol. 25 (1989): 
 Oct. 23, Presidential statement. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 467 
 
9.  Lowell 

 
PUBLIC LAW 99–190—DEC. 19, 1985 99 STAT. 1185 

 
Public Law 99–190 
99th Congress 
 

Joint Resolution 
 

 

Dec. 19, 1985 Making further continuing appropriations for the fiscal year 1986, and for other 
purposes. [H.J. Res. 465] 

 
 Resolved by the Senate and House of Representatives of the United 
States of America in Congress assembled, 
 

*            *            *            *            *            *            * 
 

TITLE I—DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR 
 

*            *            *            *            *            *            * 
 

NATIONAL PARK SERVICE 
 

OPERATION OF THE NATIONAL PARK SYSTEM 
 

*            *            *            *            *            *            * 
. . . Provided further, That the educational center to be located at the 
Boott Mill Complex, Building No. 6, in the Lowell National 
Historical Park, Massachusetts, is hereby designated and shall be 
known as the “Paul E. Tsongas Industrial History Center”: . . . 
 

*            *            *            *            *            *            *  
 
  Approved December 19, 1985. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.J. Res. 465: 
HOUSE REPORTS: No. 99–403 (Comm. on Appropriations), No. 99–443 and No. 

     99–450 (Comm. of Conference). 
SENATE REPORT No. 99–210 (Comm. on Appropriations). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 131 (1985): 
 Dec. 4, considered and passed House.  
 Dec. 6, 9, 10, considered and passed Senate, amended. 
 Dec. 19, House and Senate agreed to conference report. 
 

 

 
 
 
 
99 STAT. 1224 
Department of 
the Interior and 
Related Agencies 
Appropriations 
Act, 1986. 
 
99 STAT. 1228 
 
 
 
 
 
99 STAT. 1229  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
99 STAT. 1326 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



468 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 

 
101 STAT. 810 PUBLIC LAW 100–134—OCT. 16, 1987 
 
 Public Law 100–134 

100th Congress 
An Act 

 
Oct. 16, 1987 
[H.R. 2035] 

To amend the Act establishing Lowell National Historical Park, and for other 
purposes. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410cc–13. 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410cc–31. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410cc–13 
note. 

 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, 
 
SECTION 1. AMENDMENTS. 
 
 The Act entitled “An Act to provide for the establishment of the 
Lowell National Historical Park in the Commonwealth of 
Massachusetts, and for other purposes”, approved June 5, 1978 (92 
Stat. 290; 16 U.S.C. 410cc et seq.), is amended— 

(1) in section 103(a)— 
 (A) by striking “$18,500,000” and inserting “$19,800,000” 
in paragraph (1); and 
 (B) by striking “$21,500,000” and inserting “$33,600,000” 
in paragraph (2); 

(2) in section 301(e)(2) by striking “for a period not longer 
than thirty days” and inserting “until his successor is 
appointed”; and 

(3) in section 301(i) by striking “ten” and inserting 
“seventeen”. 

 
SEC. 2. EFFECTIVE DATES. 
 
 (a) IN GENERAL.—Except as provided in subsection (b), the 
amendments made by section 1 shall take effect on the date of the 
enactment of this Act. 
 (b) EFFECTIVE DATE OF AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATION.—The 
amendments made by section 1(1) shall take effect on October 1, 
1987. 
 
 Approved October 16, 1987. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 2035 (S. 1012): 

HOUSE REPORTS: No. 100–303 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 133 (1987): 

Sept. 29, considered and passed House. 
Oct. 1, considered and passed Senate. 

 
 
 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 469 
 
 

10. Natchez 
 

PUBLIC LAW 100–479—OCT. 7, 1988 102 STAT. 2324 
 
Public Law 100–479 
100th Congress 
 

An Act 
 

 

Oct. 7, 1988 To create a national park at Natchez, Mississippi. 
 [H.R. 4457] 

 
   Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, 
 
SECTION 1. PURPOSES. 
 
 The purposes of this Act are to— 

(1) preserve and interpret the history of Natchez, Mississippi, 
as  a  significant   city  in   the   history  of  the American   South; 

(2) preserve and interpret the sites and structures associated 
with all the peoples of Natchez and its surrounding area from 
earliest inhabitants to the modern era, and including blacks 
both slave and free; 

(3) preserve and interpret the region’s social, political, and 
economic development, with particular emphasis on the pre- and 
post-Civil War eras; and 

  (4) preserve  and   interpret  the  region’s  commercial and agri- 
  cultural history, especially  in  relation  to   the Mississippi River 
  and cotton. 
 
 

 

 
 
 
Historic 
preservation. 
Conservation. 
16 USC 410oo. 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



470 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS  
 
102 STAT. 2324 PUBLIC LAW 100–479—OCT. 7, 1988 
 
 
16 USC 410oo–1. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Public 
Information. 
District of 
Columbia 

 
SEC. 2. ESTABLISHMENT OF NATCHEZ NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARK. 
 
 (a) IN GENERAL.—In order to provide for the benefit, inspiration, 
and education of the American people, there is hereby established 
the Natchez National Historical Park (hereinafter in this Act 
referred to as the “park”) in the State of Mississippi. 
 (b) AREA INCLUDED.—The park shall consist of the historic 
districts established under this Act and the following properties: 

(1) The lands and structures known as Melrose, together with 
all personal property located on such lands. 

(2) The lands and improvements thereon known as, or 
associated with, Fort Rosalie. 

The property referred to in paragraph (2) shall be included within 
the park only if the Secretary of the Interior (hereinafter in this Act 
referred to as the “Secretary”) determines that the historic resources 
of Fort Rosalie are of sufficient national significance and integrity to 
warrant inclusion in the National Park System.  The Secretary shall 
make such determination after receiving from the Governor of the 
State of Mississippi and the mayor of the city of Natchez, in 
consultation with the State Historic Preservation Officer, a 
recommendation based on scholarly research as to the national 
significance and integrity of such historic resources. 
 (c) BOUNDARIES; MAP.—The Secretary shall prepare a map of the 
lands included within the park. Such map shall be on file and 
available for public inspection in the offices of the National Park 
Service at the park and at the Department of the Interior in the 
District of Columbia. The Secretary may from time to time make 
minor revisions in the boundary of the park in accordance with 
section 7(c) of the Land and Water Conservation Fund Act of 1965 
(16 U.S.C. 4601–4 and following). 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 471 
 

PUBLIC LAW 100–479—OCT. 7, 1988 102 STAT. 2325 
 
SEC. 3. ACQUISITION OF PROPERTY. 
 
 Except as otherwise provided in this section, the Secretary may 
acquire, by donation, purchase with donated or appropriated funds, 
or exchange, land or interests in land, together with structures and 
other improvements thereon and personal property, which is 
included within the park. In addition the Secretary may acquire by 
any such means such personal property associated with the park as 
he deems appropriate for interpretation of the park and such 
additional lands and properties as may be necessary for purposes of 
an administrative headquarters and administrative site. Any land, 
interests in land, structures, improvements, or personal property 
owned by the State of Mississippi or any political subdivision 
thereof, may be acquired only by donation. The Secretary may not 
acquire fee title to any property other than the property he deems 
necessary for an administrative site and headquarters and the 
property referred to in paragraph (1) or (2) of section 2, and the 
Secretary may not acquire the property referred to in paragraph (1) 
of section 2 unless at least 25 per centum of the fair market value of 
such property (as determined by the Secretary) is donated to the 
United States in connection with such acquisition. 
 
SEC. 4. ADMINISTRATION OF PARK. 
 
 (a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall administer the park in 
accordance with this Act and with the provisions of law generally 
applicable to units of the National Park System, including the Act 
entitled “An Act to establish a National Park Service, and for other 
purposes”, approved August 25, 1916 (39 Stat. 535; 16 U.S.C. 1–4) 
and the Act of August 21, 1935 (49 Stat. 666; 16 U.S.C. 461–467). 
Properties acquired under this Act for purposes of inclusion in the 
park shall be available for visitor inspection and enjoyment as 
promptly as practicable after the date of acquisition notwithstanding 
the absence of a park management plan. 
 (b) DONATIONS.—Notwithstanding any other provision of law, the 
Secretary may accept and expend donations of funds, property, or 
services from individuals, foundations, corporations, or public 
entities for the purpose of providing services and facilities which he 
deems consistent with the purposes of this Act. 
 (c) HISTORIC DISTRICTS.— 

(1) STUDY OF HISTORIC PROPERTIES.—The Secretary shall 
prepare and transmit to the Committee on Interior and Insular 
Affairs of the United States House of Representatives and to the 
Committee on Energy and Natural Resources of the United 
States Senate a study of the properties in the city of Natchez 
and its immediate environs that preserve and interpret the 
history contained in the purposes of this Act. Such report shall 
consider which properties best exemplify such purposes and 
appropriate means for providing technical assistance to, and 
interpretation of, such properties. The study and report shall 
include consideration of Natchez-Under-the-Hill and the Briars. 

(2) ESTABLISHMENT OF DISTRICTS.—Following completion of the 
study under paragraph (1), but not later than one year after the 
date of enactment of this Act, the Secretary shall establish 
historic districts in the city of Natchez and its immediate 
environs for the preservation and interpretation of the resources 
that contribute to the understanding of the purposes of this Act. 

 

16 USC 410oo–2. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410oo–3. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Public 
information. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Reports. 

 
 



472 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS  
 
102 STAT. 2326 PUBLIC LAW 100–479—OCT. 7, 1988 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Gifts and 
property. 
16 USC 410oo–4. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410oo–5. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Public 
information. 

(3) COOPERATIVE AGREEMENTS WITH OWNERS.—In furtherance 
of the purposes of this Act, and after consultation with the 
Advisory Commission established by this Act, the Secretary is 
authorized to enter into cooperative agreements with the owners 
of properties of historical or cultural significance (as determined 
by the Secretary) within any historic district established under 
this subsection. Such agreements shall permit the Secretary to 
mark, interpret, improve, restore, and provide technical 
assistance with respect to the preservation and interpretation of 
such properties. Such agreements shall contain, but need not be 
limited to, provisions that the Secretary shall have the right of 
access at reasonable times to public portions of any property 
covered by such agreement for purposes of conducting visitors 
through such properties and interpreting them to the public, and 
that no changes or alterations shall be made in the property 
except by mutual agreement between the Secretary and other 
parties to the agreement. 

 (d) GENERAL MANAGEMENT PLAN.—Within three complete fiscal 
years after the enactment of this Act, the Secretary shall submit to 
the Committee on Interior and Insular Affairs of the United States 
House of Representatives and to the Committee on Energy and 
Natural Resources of the United States Senate a general 
management plan for the park. The plan shall be prepared in 
accordance with section 12(b) of the Act of August 18, 1970 (84 Stat. 
825; 16 U.S.C. 1a–1 through 1a–7). Such plan shall identify 
appropriate facilities for proper interpretation of the site for visitors. 
 
SEC. 5. NATCHEZ TRACE STUDY. 
 
 The Secretary shall prepare, in consultation with the city of 
Natchez, a study of the feasibility of extending the Natchez Trace 
within the city of Natchez, including the acceptance of donations of 
rights-of-way. The Secretary shall transmit the study to the 
Committee on Interior and Insular Affairs of the United States 
House of Representatives and to the Committee on Energy and 
Natural Resources of the United States Senate within one year after 
the date of enactment of this Act. 
 
SEC. 6. ADVISORY COMMISSION. 
 
 (a) ESTABLISHMENT.—There is hereby established the Natchez 
National Historical Park Advisory Commission (hereinafter in this 
Act referred to as the “Advisory Commission”). The Advisory 
Commission shall be composed of six members appointed by the 
Secretary. Two of such members shall be appointed from among 
individuals nominated by the mayor of Natchez and one from among 
individuals nominated by the Governor of Mississippi. Two of the 
members shall have expertise in historic preservation and one shall 
have expertise in architectural history. Any member of the Advisory 
Commission appointed for a definite term may serve after the 
expiration of his term until his successor is appointed. The Advisory 
Commission shall designate one of its members as Chairperson. 
 (b) MANAGEMENT AND DEVELOPMENT ISSUES.—The Secretary, or 
his designee, shall from time to time, but at least semi-annually, 
meet and consult with the Advisory Commission on matters relating 
to the management and development of the park. 
 (c) MEETINGS.—The Advisory Commission shall meet on a regular 
basis. Notice of meetings and agenda shall be published in local 
newspapers which  have  a  distribution  which generally  covers  the 
 

 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 473 
 

PUBLIC LAW 100–479—OCT. 7, 1988 102 STAT. 2327 
 
area affected by the park. Advisory Commission meetings shall be 
held at locations and in such a manner as to ensure adequate public 
involvement. 
 (d) EXPENSES.—Members of the Advisory Commission shall serve 
without compensation as such, but the Secretary may pay expenses 
reasonably incurred in carrying out their responsibilities under this 
Act on vouchers signed by the Chairman. 
 (e) CHARTER.—The provisions of section 14(b) of the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act (Act of October 6, 1972; 86 Stat. 776), are 
hereby waived with respect to this Advisory Commission. 
 
SEC. 7. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS. 
 
 There are hereby authorized to be appropriated not to exceed 
$12,000,000 to carry out this Act. 
 
 Approved October 7, 1987. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410oo–6. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
   
LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 4457: 
HOUSE REPORTS: No. 100–793 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs).  
SENATE REPORTS: No. 100–538 (Comm. on Energy and Natural Resources). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 134 (1988): 

July 26, considered and passed House. 
Sept. 27, considered and passed Senate. 

 

 

 
 



474 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS  
 
104 STAT. 860 PUBLIC LAW 101–399—SEPT. 28, 1990 
 
 Public Law 101–399 

101st Congress 
An Act 

 
Sept. 28, 1990 

[H.R. 4501] 
To provide for the acquisition of the William Johnson House and its addition to 

the Natchez National Historical Park, and for other purposes. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
Mississippi. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Real property. 
Gifts and 
property. 

 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives or the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, 
 
SECTION 1. ACQUISITION OF WILLIAM JOHNSON HOUSE. 
 
 (a) INCLUSION WITHIN NATCHEZ NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARK.—
Section 2(b) of the Act entitled “An Act to create a national park at 
Natchez, Mississippi” (16 U.S.C. 410oo–1(b)) is amended by inserting 
after paragraph (2) the following new paragraph: 
 “(3) The lands and structures known as the William Johnson 
House, together with all personal property located on such lands, 
and the building adjacent thereto which bears a common wall.”. 
 (b) ACQUISITION AUTHORITY.—Section 3 of such Act (16 U.S.C. 
410oo–2) is amended— 

(1) by striking “paragraph (1) or (2)” and inserting “paragraph 
(1), (2), or (3)”; and 

(2) by adding at the end the following: “The Secretary may not 
acquire the property referred to in paragraph (3) of section 2(b) 
except by donation.”. 

 
 Approved September 28, 1990. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 4501: 

HOUSE REPORTS: No. 101–550 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
SENATE REPORTS: No. 101–424 (Comm. on Energy and Natural Resources). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 136 (1990): 

June 25, considered and passed House.  
Sept. 11, considered and passed Senate. 

 
 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 475 
 

11. Pecos 
 

PUBLIC LAW 101–313—JUNE 27, 1990 104 STAT. 272 
 
Public Law 101–313 
101st Congress 

An Act 
 

 

June 27, 1990 To establish Petroglyph National Monument and Pecos National Historical Park 
in the State of New Mexico, and for other purposes. [S. 286] 

 
 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled,   
 

*            *            *            *            *            *            * 
TITLE II—PECOS NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARK 

 
 SEC. 201. The purpose of this title is— 

 (1) to  recognize   the    multitheme   history,   including   the 
 cultural interaction among   diverse   groups  of   people, of  the  
 Pecos area  and  its   “gateway”  role between  the  Great Plains 
 and the Rio Grande Valley, and 

 (2) to provide  for the  preservation and interpretation  of the 
 cultural and  natural  resources of the Forked Lightning Ranch 
 by establishing the Pecos National Historical Park. 

 SEC. 202. (a) In order to enhance and preserve the existing Pecos 
National Monument and related nationally significant resources for 
the benefit and enjoyment of present and future generations, there is 
hereby established the Pecos National Historical Park (hereinafter 
in this title referred to as the “park”). 
 (b) The park shall include the existing Pecos National Monument 
and the area known as the Forked Lightning Ranch which surrounds 
the Pecos National Monument and shall consist of approximately 
5,865 acres of the lands and interests in lands as generally depicted 
on the map entitled “Pecos National Historical Park Boundary 
Concept”, numbered 430/80028 and dated March 1990. The map 
shall be on file and available for public inspection in the offices of the 
National Park Service, Department of the Interior. The Secretary of 
the Interior (hereinafter in this title referred to as the “Secretary”) 
may from time to time make minor revisions in the boundary of the 
park in accordance with section 7(c) of the Land and Water 
Conservation Fund Act of 1965 (16 U.S.C. 4601–4 and following). 
 (c) The Act entitled “An Act to authorize the establishment of 
Pecos National Monument in the State of New Mexico, and  for other 

 

 
Public lands. 
 
 
 
104 STAT. 278 
 
 
Conservation. 
16 USC 410rr. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Establishment. 
16 USC 410rr–1. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



476 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 
 
104 STAT. 279 PUBLIC LAW 101–313—JUNE 27, 1990 
 
 
 
 
 
Gifts and 
property. 
16 USC 410rr–2. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410rr–3. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410rr–4.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410rr–5. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Appropriation 
authorization. 
16 USC 410rr–6.  
 
 
 
104 STAT. 280 

purposes” approved June 28, 1965 (79 Stat. 195), is hereby repealed, 
and any funds available for purposes of the Pecos National 
Monument shall be available for purposes of the park. 
 SEC. 203. The Secretary is authorized to acquire lands, waters, 
and interests therein within the boundaries of the park by donation, 
purchase with donated or appropriated funds, or exchange: Provided, 
however, That the Secretary may not acquire lands within the 
Forked Lightning Ranch as depicted on the map from the owner of 
record of such lands as of May 1, 1990, without the consent of such 
owner unless the Secretary determines that the lands are being 
used, or that there is an imminent threat that the lands will be used, 
for any purpose that is incompatible with the purposes of this Act. 
 SEC. 204. The Secretary shall administer the park in accordance 
with the provisions of this title and the provisions of law generally 
applicable to the administration of units of the National Park 
System, including the Act of August 25, 1916 (39 Stat. 535; 16 U.S.C. 
1, 2–4), and the Act of August 21, 1935 (49 Stat. 666; 16 U.S.C. 461–
7). 
 SEC. 205. Within 3 full fiscal years from the date funding is made 
available for the purposes of preparing a general management plan, 
the Secretary shall develop and transmit to the Committee on 
Energy and Natural Resources of the Senate and the Committee on 
Interior and Insular Affairs of the House of Representatives, a 
general management plan for the park consistent with the purposes 
of this title, including (but not limited to)— 

(1) a general visitor use and interpretive program that fully 
considers the prehistoric and historic aspects of the national 
historical park including the “gateway theme” and early Spanish 
settlement of New Mexico; 

(2) a statement on the number of visitors and types of public 
uses within the park which can be reasonably accommodated in 
accordance with the protection of its resources; and 

(3) a general development plan for the park, including the 
estimated cost thereof. 

 SEC. 206. The Secretary, acting through the National Park 
Service, shall undertake a study of the Rowe Ruin, Arrowhead 
Pueblo, Hobson-Dressler Ruin, and Las Ruedas site for the 
suitability and feasibility of their inclusion in the park. The 
Secretary shall submit the study to the Congress within one year 
after the date of enactment of this title. 
 SEC. 207. There is authorized to be appropriated such sums as 
may be necessary to carry out this title.  
 

*            *            *            *            *            *            * 
 

   Approved June 27, 1990. 
 
 

 

 LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—S. 296: 
HOUSE REPORTS: No. 101–491 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
SENATE REPORTS: No. 101–230 (Comm. on Energy and Natural Resources). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 136 (1990): 

Jan. 24, considered and passed Senate. 
May 21, 22, considered and passed House, amended. 
June 12, Senate concurred in House amendments with amendments. 
June 14, House concurred in Senate amendments. 

WEEKLY COMPILATION OF PRESIDENTIAL DOCUMENTS, Vol. 26 (1990): 
June 27, Presidential statement. 

 
 
 
 
 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 477 
 

PUBLIC LAW 101–536—NOV. 8, 1990 104 STAT. 2368 
 
Public Law 101–536 
101st Congress 

An Act 
 

 

Nov. 8, 1990 To authorize the establishment: of the Glorieta Nations Battlefield in the State of 
New Mexico, and for other purposes. [H.R. 4090] 

 
 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled,   
 
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE. 
 
 This Act may be cited as the “Pecos National Historical Park 
Expansion Act of 1990”. 
 
SEC. 2. FINDINGS AND PURPOSE. 
 
 (a) FINDINGS.—The Congress makes the following findings: 

 (1) the Civil War battle of Glorieta Pass, New Mexico, fought 
 on March 26–28, 1862, was a decisive battle of the Civil War in 
 the Far West; 

 (2) the battle was significant because the Confederate defeat 
 at Glorieta Pass  resulted in  the collapse  of  the Confederacy’s 
 plan to capture the riches and support of the West, thus largely 
 ending the Civil War in the West; and 

 (3) the   campsite  and   headquarters of the Union forces   
 during the Battle of Glorieta are currently within the boundary 
 of Pecos National Historical Park. 

 (b) PURPOSE.—The purpose of this Act is to preserve and 
interpret the Battle of Glorieta and to enhance visitor understanding 
of the Civil War and the Far West by establishing a new unit of 
Pecos National Historical Park. 
 
SEC. 3. ESTABLISHMENT OF THE GLORIETA UNIT OF THE PECOS NATIONAL 

HISTORICAL PARK. 
 
 (a) ESTABLISHMENT.—In order to preserve and interpret the 
Battle of Glorieta for the benefit and enjoyment of present and 
future generations, there is hereby established the Glorieta Unit of 
the Pecos National Historical Park (hereafter in this Act referred to 
as the “Glorieta Unit”). The Glorieta Unit shall be comprised of 
approximately 682 acres as generally depicted on the maps entitled 
“Glorieta Unit—Pecos National Historical Park”, numbered 430–
80,031, and dated July 1990. The boundary of Pecos National 
Historical Park, established by title II of Public Law 101–313 (104 
Stat. 278), is hereby modified to include the Glorieta Unit. 
 (b) ADMINISTRATION.—The Secretary shall administer the 
Glorieta Unit to preserve and interpret the Battle of Glorieta for the 
benefit and enjoyment of present and future generations, in 
accordance with the provisions of this Act, applicable provisions of 
title II of Public Law 101–313, and provisions of law generally 
applicable to units of the National Park System, including the Act of 
August 25, 1916 (39 Stat. 535: 16 U.S.C. 1–4), and the Act of August 
21, 1935 (49 U. S. C. 666; 16 U.S.C. 461–7). 
 (c) ACQUISITION.—The Secretary is authorized to acquire lands, 
waters, and interests therein  within the  boundaries of  the Glorieta  

 

 
 
 
Pecos National 
Historical Park 
Expansion Act of 
1990. 
Historic 
preservation. 
16 USC 410rr 
note. 
16 USC 410rr–7 
note. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410rr–7. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 



478 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 
 
104 STAT. 2369 PUBLIC LAW 101–536—NOV. 8, 1990 
 
 Unit by donation, purchase with donated or appropriated funds, or 

exchange. Lands may not be acquired for purposes of the Glorieta 
Unit without the consent of the owner thereof unless the Secretary 
determines that, in his judgment, the property is subject to, or 
threatened with, uses which are having, or would have, an adverse 
impact on the Glorieta Unit or on the management of the Glorieta 
Unit. 
 (d) TRANSFER.—Lands identified on the maps referred to in 
subsection (a) as being within unit number 26 in the “Historic Zone” 
are hereby transferred from the administration of the Secretary of 
Agriculture to the administration of the Secretary of the Interior, to 
be managed in accordance with the provisions of this Act. 
 (e) MANAGEMENT PLAN.—The Secretary shall incorporate 
management direction for the Glorieta Unit into the general 
management plan for the Pecos National Historical Park, including 
the identification of routes of travel associated with the Battle of 
Glorieta. 
 (f) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—There are hereby 
authorized to be appropriated such sums as may be necessary to 
carry out the purposes of this Act. 
 
 Approved November 8, 1990. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 4090: 
HOUSE REPORTS: No 101–828 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 136 (1990): 

Oct. 10, considered and passed House.  
  Oct. 24, considered and passed Senate. 
 

 
 
 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 479 
 

12.   San Antonio Missions 
 

PUBLIC LAW 101–628—NOV. 28, 1990 104 STAT. 4469 
 
Public Law 101–628 
101st Congress  

An Act 
 

 

Nov. 28, 1990 To provide for the designation of certain public lands as wilderness in the State of 
Arizona. [H.R. 2570] 

 
 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, 
 

*            *            *            *            *            *            * 
 

TITLE V—NATIONAL PARK SYSTEM UNITS IN TEXAS 
 
SEC. 501. EXPANSION OF SAN ANTONIO MISSIONS NATIONAL HISTORICAL 

PARK. 
 
 (a) EXPANSION.—Section 201(a) of the Act entitled “An Act to 
amend the Pennsylvania Avenue Development Corporation Act of 
1972; to provide for the establishment of the San Antonio Missions 
National Historical Park; and other purposes” (16 U.S.C. 410ee(a)) is 
amended by inserting after the first sentence the following: “The 
park shall also consist of the lands and interests therein within the 
area bounded by the line depicted as ‘Proposed Boundary Extension’ 
on the maps entitled ‘San Antonio Missions National Historical 
Park’, numbered 472–80,075, 472–80,076, 472–80,077, 472–80,078, 
472–80,079, 472–80,080, and 472–80,081 and dated June 7, 1990, 
which shall be on file and available for public inspection in the same 
manner as is such drawing.”. 
 (b) DEVELOPMENT OF ESSENTIAL PUBLIC FACILITIES.—Section 
201(f)(2) of such Act is amended by striking “not more than 
$500,000.” and inserting “not more than $15,000,000.”.  
 

*            *            *            *            *            *            * 
 

   Approved November 28, 1990.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 2570: 
HOUSE REPORTS: No. 101–405 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
SENATE REPORTS: No. 101–359 (Comm. on Energy and Natural Resources). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 136 (1990): 

Feb. 28, considered and passed House. 
Oct. 27, considered and passed Senate, amended. House concurred in 

Senate amendment with an amendment. Senate concurred in House 
amendment. 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
104 STAT. 4492  
Natural 
resources.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
104 STAT. 4510 
 
 

 
 
 



480 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS   
 

13. San Francisco Maritime 
 

102 STAT. 654 PUBLIC LAW 100–348—JUNE 27, 1988 
 
 Public Law 100–348 

100th Congress 
An Act 

 
June 27, 1988 

[H.R. 1044] 
To establish the San Francisco Maritime National Historical Park in the State of 

California, and for other purposes. 
 

 
 
 
San Francisco 
Maritime 
National 
Historical Park 
Act of 1988. 
Conservation. 
National Parks, 
monuments, etc. 
16 USC 410nn 
note. 
Public 
information. 
16 USC 410nn. 
Real property. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Real property. 
Gifts and 
property. 
Public buildings 
and grounds. 

 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, 
 
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE. 
 
 This Act may be cited as the “San Francisco Maritime National 
Historical Park Act of 1988”. 
 
SEC. 2. ESTABLISHMENT. 
 
 (a) IN GENERAL.—In order to preserve and interpret the history 
and achievements of seafaring Americans and of the Nation’s 
maritime heritage, especially on the Pacific coast, there is hereby 
established the San Francisco Maritime National Historical Park 
(hereinafter in this Act referred to as the “park”). 
 (b) AREA INCLUDED.—The park shall consist of the lands and 
interests therein within the area generally depicted on the map 
entitled “Boundary Map, San Francisco Maritime National 
Historical Park”, numbered 641/80,053 and dated April 7, 1987. The 
map shall be on file and available for public inspection in the offices 
of the National Park Service, Department of the Interior and in the 
office of the Superintendent of the park. If the Secretary of the 
Interior (hereinafter in this Act referred to as the “Secretary”) 
determines, upon completion of the General Management Plan for 
the park, that the inclusion of the property at Jefferson and Hyde 
Streets, San Francisco, known as the Haslett Warehouse, would 
promote the purposes of the park, the Secretary may adjust the 
boundaries of the park to include that property after notification to 
the Committee on Interior and Insular Affairs of the United States 
House of Representatives and the Committee on Energy and Natural 
Resources of the United States Senate. The Secretary may make 
other minor revisions of the boundary of the park in accordance with 
section 7(c) of the Land and Water Conservation Fund Act of 1965. 
 (c) GOLDEN GATE NATIONAL RECREATION AREA.—The Secretary 
shall revise the boundaries of the Golden Gate National Recreation 
Area to exclude from the National Recreation Area the area within 
the park (as depicted on the boundary map referred to in subsection 
(b)). The Secretary shall transfer to the jurisdiction of the park all 
real and personal property of the United States administered by the 
Secretary as part of the National Recreation Area located within the 
boundaries of the park (including the museum building), together 
with all vessels, marine collections, libraries, historic documents, 
equipment and other marine artifacts which are administered by the 
Secretary as part of the National Recreation Area and which relate 
to maritime history. 
 (d) MUSEUM BUILDING.—The building housing and displaying the 
marine  collections,  libraries,  historic  documents,  equipment,   and 
 

 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 481 
 

PUBLIC LAW 100–348—JUNE 27, 1988 102 STAT. 655 
 
marine artifacts shall be named the “Sala Burton Building” and an 
appropriate plaque with this designation shall be prominently 
displayed as part of the structure. 
 
SEC. 3. ADMINISTRATION. 
 
 (a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary shall administer the park in 
accordance with this Act and with the provisions of law generally 
applicable to units of the National Park System, including the Act 
entitled “An Act to establish a National Park Service, and for other 
purposes”, approved August 25, 1916 (39 Stat. 535; 16 U.S.C. 1–4), 
the Act of August 21, 1935 (49 Stat. 666; 16 U.S.C. 461–467), and the 
National Historic Preservation Act (16 U.S.C. 470–470t). The 
Secretary shall manage the park in such manner as will preserve 
and perpetuate knowledge and understanding of American maritime 
history and to provide for public understanding and enjoyment of 
maritime history. 
 (b) DONATIONS.—The Secretary may accept and retain donations 
of funds, property, or services from individuals, foundations, 
corporations, or public entities for the purpose of providing services 
and facilities which he deems consistent with the purposes of this 
Act. 
 (c) LEASING.—The Secretary may lease any real or personal 
property, including vessels and heavy marine equipment such as 
floating drydocks, which is administered as part of the park. The net 
receipts from any such lease shall be credited in accordance with 
subsection 4(f) of the Act of October 27, 1972 (86 Stat. 1299). 
 (d) FEES.—Notwithstanding any other provision of law, the 
Secretary may impose entrance fees for admission to the ships in 
such amounts as he deems appropriate and may impose fees for the 
use by groups or organizations of the ships. All receipts from such 
fees shall be credited in accordance with subsection 4(f) of the Act of 
October 27, 1972 (86 Stat. 1299). 
 (e) GENERAL MANAGEMENT PLAN.—Within 2 years after 
establishment of the park, the Secretary shall prepare and transmit 
to the Committee on Interior and Insular Affairs of the United 
States House of Representatives and the Committee on Energy and 
Natural Resources of the United States Senate a general 
management plan for the park. The plan shall include, but not be 
limited to: 

(1) a description of the resources of the park including, but not 
limited to, maritime and associated artifacts, documents, the 
following historic vessels: the sailing ship Balclutha; the steam 
schooner Wapama; the steamship SS Jeremiah O’Brien, the 
ferry Eureka; the schooner C.A. Thayer; the tug Ellpleton Hall; 
the tug Hercules; and the scow schooner Alma, and other real 
and personal property comprising the park collections such as 
written and illustrative material, objects, wrecks, small 
watercraft, and vessels; 

(2) plans for the preservation of each historic vessel, including 
docking facilities, maintenance and ship repair facilities, and 
estimates for the costs thereof; a determination of the need for 
permanent docking facilities in a location best suited to the 
preservation of the historic vessels and for visitor access to the 
historic vessels; methods of accommodating visitors while 
protecting the historic vessels; and methods for providing for the 
proper care, exhibition, and storage of the park collections; 

(3) plans for the location, preliminary design, and estimated 
cost of public facilities to be developed for the park, including a 
museum building, visitor parking, and public transit access;  and 

 

 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410nn–1. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Gifts and 
property. 
 
 
 
 
Real property. 
Gifts and 
property. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Real property. 
Gifts and 
property. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Public buildings 
and grounds. 

 
 



482 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS   
 
102 STAT. 656 PUBLIC LAW 100–348—JUNE 27, 1988 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410nn–2. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Contracts. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410nn–3. 

(4) Plans for the interpretation of the historic vessels and park 
collections. 

 
SEC. 4. ACQUISITION OF PROPERTY. 
 
 (a) GENERAL AUTHORITY.—The Secretary may acquire land and 
interests in land within the boundaries of the park by donation, 
purchase with donated or appropriated funds, or exchange. 
 (b) TRANSFERS FROM OTHER AGENCIES.—The Secretary of 
Commerce may transfer the Liberty Ship SS Jeremiah O’Brien to 
the Secretary for inclusion in the historic fleet of the park. Any other 
Federal property located within the boundaries of the park which is 
under the administrative jurisdiction of another department or 
agency of the United States may, with the concurrence of the head of 
the administering department or agency, be transferred without 
consideration to the administrative jurisdiction of the Secretary for 
the purposes of the park. 
 (c) STATE AND LOCAL LANDS.—Lands, and interests in lands, 
within the boundaries of the park which are owned by the State of 
California or any political subdivision thereof, may be acquired only 
by donation. Notwithstanding any other provision of law, the 
Secretary is authorized to enter into an agreement with the State of 
California or any political subdivision thereof under which the 
Secretary may improve and may use appropriated funds for the 
improvement of berthing facilities if the State or any political 
subdivision thereof makes available to the Secretary, in accordance 
with terms and conditions acceptable to the Secretary, lands and 
interests in land for the purpose of berthing the ships and providing 
visitor access to the historic ships. 
 (d)(1) HISTORIC VESSELS AND OTHER PROPERTY.—In furtherance of 
the administration of the park, the Secretary is authorized to 
acquire by donation, purchase with donated or appropriated funds, 
or exchange such property as may be appropriate to carry out the 
purposes of this Act, including vessels, heavy marine equipment, and 
drydock facilities. The Secretary shall notify the Committee on 
Interior and Insular Affairs of the United States House of 
Representatives and the Committee on Energy and Natural 
Resources of the United States Senate in writing not less than 90 
days before acquisition of any large historic vessel. Such notification 
shall indicate the estimated cost of preservation, restoration if 
appropriate, and maintenance of the vessel concerned. 
 (2) ACQUISITION LIMITATION.—The Secretary shall not acquire 
any historic vessel pursuant to this subsection until the Secretary 
has notified the Committees in writing that sufficient funds have 
been made available to preserve and maintain those vessels listed in 
paragraph 3(e)(1) of this Act. 
 
SEC. 5. ADVISORY COMMISSION. 
 
 (a) ESTABLISHMENT.—There is hereby established the Advisory 
Commission of the San Francisco Maritime National Historical Park 
(hereinafter in this Act referred to as the “Commission”). The 
Commission shall be composed of 12 members appointed by the 
Secretary as follows: 

(1) 3 members appointed for terms of 4 years from 
recommendations submitted by the National Maritime Museum 
Association. 

(2) 2 members appointed for terms of 4 years from 
recommendations   submitted   by  the  Governor  of  the State of 

 
 
 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 483 
 

PUBLIC LAW 100–348—JUNE 27, 1988 102 STAT. 657 
 

California, at least one of whom shall have professional 
expertise in maritime historic preservation. 

(3) 4 members appointed for terms of 5 years from 
recommendations submitted by the Mayor of San Francisco with 
special consideration given to individuals with knowledge of 
museum and/or maritime issues and who represent the local 
fishing industry, recreational users, the business community, 
and neighborhood groups. 

(4) 1 member appointed for a term of 5 years from 
recommendations from the Secretary of Commerce, who shall 
have professional expertise in the maritime industry. 

(5) 2 members appointed for terms of 5 years, who shall have 
professional expertise in maritime history or historic 
preservation. 

Any member of the Commission appointed for a definite term may 
serve after the expiration of his term until his successor is 
appointed. A vacancy in the Commission shall be filled in the 
manner in which the original appointment was made. 
 (b) COMPENSATION.—Members of the Commission shall serve 
without pay. While away from their homes or regular places of 
business in the performance of services for the Commission, 
members of the Commission shall be allowed travel expenses, 
including per diem in lieu of subsistence, in the same manner as 
persons employed intermittently in Government service are allowed 
expenses under section 5703 of title 5 of the United States Code. 
 (c) OFFICERS.—The Chair and other officers of the Commission 
shall be elected by a majority of the members of the Commission to 
serve for terms established by the Commission. 
 (d) MEETINGS.—The Commission shall meet at the call of the 
Chair or a majority of its members, but not less than twice annually. 
Seven members of the Commission shall constitute a quorum. 
Consistent with the public meeting requirement of the Federal 
Advisory Committee Act, the Commission shall, from time to time, 
meet with persons concerned with maritime preservation. 
 (e) BYLAWS AND CHARTER.—The Commission may make such 
bylaws, rules, and regulations as it considers necessary to carry out 
its functions under this Act. The provisions of section 14(b) of the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act (Act of October 6, 1972; 86 Stat. 
776), are hereby waived with respect to this Commission. 
 (f) FUNCTIONS.—The Commission shall advise the Secretary on 
the management and development of the park. The Secretary, or his 
designee, shall from time to time, but at least semiannually, meet 
and consult with the Commission on matters relating to the 
management and development of the park. 
 (g) TERMINATION.—The Commission shall cease to exist 10 years 
after the date on which the first meeting of  the Commission is  held. 
 
SEC. 6. CONFORMING AMENDMENT. 
 
 Section 4(f) of the Act of October 27, 1972 (16 U.S.C. 460bb–3(f)), 
is amended by striking out “National Maritime Museum” and 
inserting “San Francisco Maritime National Historical Park”. 
 

 

 
 



484 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS   
 
102 STAT. 658 PUBLIC LAW 100–348—JUNE 27, 1988 
 
16 USC 410nn–4. SEC. 7. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS. 

 
 There are hereby authorized to be appropriated such sums as 
may be necessary to carry out the purposes of this Act, but not to 
exceed $200,000 for planning. 
 
 Approved June 27, 1988. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 1044: 

HOUSE REPORTS: No. 100–73 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
SENATE REPORTS: No. 100–373 (Comm. on Energy and Natural Resources). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD: 

Vol. 133 (1987): May 4, considered and passed House. 
Vol. 134 (1988): June 6, considered and passed Senate, amended. 

June 14, House concurred in Senate amendments. 
 

 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 485 
 

14. Tumacacori 
 

PUBLIC LAW 101–344—AUG. 6, 1990 104 STAT. 393 
 
Public Law 101–344 
101st Congress 

An Act 
 

 

Aug. 6, 1990 To establish the Tumacacori National Historical Park in the State of Arizona. 
 [H.R. 2843] 

 
 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United Stases of America in Congress assembled,  
 
SECTION 1. TUMACACORI NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARK. 
 
 (a) ESTABLISHMENT.—In order to protect and interpret, for the 
education and benefit of the public sites, in the State of Arizona 
associated with the early Spanish missionaries and explorers of the 
17th and 18th centuries, there is hereby established the Tumacacori 
National Historical Park (hereinafter in this Act referred to as the 
“park”). 
 (b) AREA INCLUDED.—The park shall consist of the existing 
Tumacacori National Monument, together with (1) the ruins of Los 
Santos Angeles de Guevavi, the first mission in Arizona (consisting 
of approximately 8 acres) and (2) the Kino visita and rancheria ruins 
of Calabazas (consisting of approximately 22 acres), each as 
generally depicted on the map entitled “Boundary Map, Tumacacori 
National Historical Park’’, numbered 311/80018, and dated February 
1990. The map shall be on file and available for public inspection in 
the offices of the National Park Service, Department of the Interior. 
 (c) ABOLITION OF MONUMENT.—The Tumacacori National 
Monument is hereby abolished and any funds available for purposes 
of the monument shall be available for purposes of the park. 
 
SEC. 2. ADMINISTRATION. 
 
 (a) IN GENERAL.—The Secretary of the Interior (hereinafter 
referred to as the “Secretary”) shall administer the park in 
accordance with this Act and with the provisions of law generally 
applicable to units of the national park system, including the Act 
entitled “An Act to establish a National Park Service, and for other 
purposes”, approved August 25, 1916 (39 Stat. 535; 16 U.S.C. 1–4) 
and the Act of August 21, 1935 (49 Stat. 666; 16 U.S.C. 461–467). 
The Secretary may acquire lands or interests in land within the 
boundaries of the park by donation, purchase with donated or 
appropriated funds, or exchange. 
 (b) DONATIONS.—Notwithstanding any other provision of law, the 
Secretary may accept and retain donations of funds, property, or 
services from individuals, foundations, corporations, or public 
entities for the purpose of providing services and facilities which he 
deems consistent with the purposes of this Act. 
 (c) SEPARATE UNITS.—The Secretary shall provide for the 
identification of the Guevavi, Calabazas, and Tumacacori sites as 3 
separate units of the park. 
 

 
Public lands. 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410ss. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 431 note. 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410ss–1. 

 
 



486 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 
 
104 STAT. 394 PUBLIC LAW 101–344—AUG. 6, 1990 
 
  (d) RECOGNITION OF FATHER EUSEBIO FRANCISCO KINO’S ROLE.—In 

administering the park, the Secretary shall utilize such 
interpretative materials and other devices as may be necessary to 
give appropriate recognition to the role of the Jesuit Missionary 
Priest, Father Eusebio Francisco Kino, in the development of the 
mission sites and the settlement of the region. 
 
 Approved August 6, 1990. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 2843: 

HOUSE REPORTS: No. 101–418 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
SENATE REPORTS: No. 101–362 (Comm. on Energy and Natural Resources). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 136 (1990): 

Mar. 13, considered and passed House. 
July 23, considered and passed Senate. 

 
 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 487 
 

15. War in the Pacific 
 

PUBLIC LAW 100–202—DEC. 22, 1987 101 STAT. 1329 
 
Public Law 100–202 
100th Congress  

Joint Resolution 
 

 

Dec. 22, 1987 Making further continuing appropriations for the fiscal year 1988, and for other 
purposes. [H.J. Res. 395] 

 
   Resolved by the Senate and House of Representatives of the United 
States of America in Congress assembled, 
 

*            *            *            *            *            *            *  
 

AN ACT 
 
Making appropriations for the Department of the Interior and Related Agencies 

for the fiscal Year ending September 30, 1988, and for other purposes. 
 

TITLE I—DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR  
  

*            *            *            *            *            *            * 
NATIONAL PARK SERVICE 

 
*            *            *            *            *            *            * 

 
LAND ACQUISITION AND STATE ASSISTANCE 

 
*            *            *            *            *            *            * 

. . . Provided further, That any Federally-owned land in War in the 
Pacific National Historical Park that hereafter becomes excess to the 
needs of the administering agency shall be transferred to the 
jurisdiction of the National Park Service, without reimbursement for 
purposes of the park. 
 

*            *            *            *            *            *            * 
 
  Approved December 22, 1987. 
 
Certified April 20, 1988. 
 

*            *            *            *            *            *            * 
 
 
 

 LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.J. Res. 395: 
 HOUSE REPORTS: No. 100–415 (Comm. on Appropriations) and No. 100–498 

(Comm. of Conference). 
 SENATE REPORTS: No. 100–238 (Comm. on Appropriations). 
 CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 133 (1987): 
  Dec. 3, considered and passed House. 
  Dec. 11, considered and passed Senate, amended. 
  Dec. 21, House and Senate agreed to conference report.  
 WEEKLY COMPILATION OF PRESIDENTIAL DOCUMENTS, Vol. 23 (1987): 

 Dec. 22, Presidential remarks. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
101 STAT. 1329-
214 
 
Department of 
the 
Interior and 
Related 
Agencies 
Appropriations 
Act, 1988.  
 
101 STAT. 1329-
218 
 
 
101 STAT. 1329-
221 
 
 
101 STAT. 1329- 
222 
16 USC 410dd 
note. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
101 STAT. 1329-
450 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 



488 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 
 

16.    Women's Rights 
 
102 STAT. 2303 PUBLIC LAW 100–475—OCT. 6, 1988 
 
 Public Law 100–475 

100th Congress 
An Act 

 
Oct. 6, 1988 
[H.R. 2952] 

To increase the amount authorized to be appropriated for acquisition at the 
Women’s Rights National Historical Park. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
   Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, 
 
SECTION 1. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS FOR ACQUISITION. 
 
 Subsection (i) of section 1601 of the Act entitled “An Act to provide, 
with respect to the national park system: for the establishment of new 
units; for adjustments in boundaries; for increases in appropriation 
authorizations for land acquisition and development; and for other 
purposes” (16 U.S.C. 410ll(i)) is amended by striking out “$490,000” 
and inserting in lieu thereof “$700,000”. 
 
 Approved October 6, 1988. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 2952: 
HOUSE REPORTS No. 100–395 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
SENATE REPORTS: No. 100–532 (Comm. on Energy and Natural Resources). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD: 

Vol. 133 (1987): Oct. 27, considered and passed House. 
Vol. 134 (1988): Sept. 28, considered and passed Senate. 

 
 

 
 
 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 489  
 
          17.   Zuni-Cibola 

 
PUBLIC LAW 100–567—OCT. 31, 1988 102 STAT. 2847 

 
Public Law 100–567 
100th Congress 

An Act 
 

 

Oct. 31, 1988 To authorize the establishment of the Zuni-Cibola National Historical Park in the 
State of New Mexico, and for other purposes. 

 
[H.R. 4182] 

 
 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, 
 
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE. 
 
 This Act may be cited as the “Zuni-Cibola National Historical 
Park Establishment Act of 1988”. 
 
SEC. 2. ESTABLISHMENT OF PARK. 
 
 (a) ESTABLISHMENT.—In order to preserve and protect for the 
benefit of present and future generations certain nationally 
significant historical, archeological, cultural, and natural sites and 
resources associated with the Zuni Tribe, and in order to assist 
members of the Zuni Tribe in preserving and interpreting their 
tribal culture, there is hereby established the Zuni-Cibola National 
Historical Park. The park shall consist of lands with respect to 
which the Secretary of the Interior has accepted a leasehold 
pursuant to section 3 of this Act. 
 (b) EFFECTIVE DATE.—This section shall take effect on the date of 
publication by the Secretary, pursuant to section 3 of this Act, of a 
notice that the Secretary has accepted a leasehold interest that 
meets the requirements of this Act. 
 (c) TERMINATION.—This section shall terminate and shall be 
ineffective 24 months after the date of enactment of this Act unless 
prior to the end of such 24-month period the Secretary has 
published a notice of acceptance of a leasehold pursuant to section 3 
of this Act. 
 
SEC. 3. ACQUISITION OF LEASEHOLD. 
 
 (a) AUTHORITY OF SECRETARY.—If, no later than 18 months after 
the date of enactment of this Act, the Zuni Tribe, after consultation 
with the Bureau of Indian Affairs, offers to the Secretary a 
leasehold interest in trust lands of the Zuni Indian Reservation, in 
New Mexico, meeting the requirements of this Act, the Secretary is 
authorized and directed to accept such leasehold on behalf of the 
National Park Service and to publish in the Federal Register a 
notice of such acceptance. 
 (b) REQUIREMENTS.—The Secretary shall accept a leasehold 
under subsection (a) of this section if such leasehold— 

(1) would continue for a period of at least 99 years; 
(2) would require no rentals or other payments by the United 

States to the Zuni Tribe or any other party; 
(3) would be applicable to no more than 800 acres of lands 

within the Zuni Indian Reservation that the Director of the 
National Park Service, after consultation with the Zuni Tribe 
and  the   Bureau  of  Indian Affairs,   has determined to   be 
nec- 

 

 
Zuni-Cibola 
National 
Historical Park 
Establishment 
Act of 1988. 
Historical 
preservation. 
16 USC 410pp 
note. 
Contracts. 
16 USC 410pp. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410pp–1. 
 
Federal 
Register, 
publication. 
 



490 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS  
 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 491  
 
102 STAT. 2848 PUBLIC LAW 100–567—OCT. 31, 1988 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410pp–2. 
 
 
National Park 
System. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Contracts. 

essary and adequate to carry out the purposes specified in 
section 4(a) of this Act; and 

(4) would not be inconsistent with any of the provisions of this 
Act. 

 (c) MAP.—As soon as possible after publication of a notice of 
acceptance pursuant to subsection (a) of this section, the Secretary 
shall prepare a map of the park and shall provide copies of such 
map to the Committee on Interior and Insular Affairs of the House 
of Representatives and the Committee on Energy and Natural 
Resources and the Select  Committee on Indian Affairs of the 
Senate. 
 (d) BOUNDARY ADJUSTMENTS.—The Secretary, after consultation 
with the Advisory Commission and with the agreement of the Zuni 
Tribe, may make minor revisions in the boundary of the park. Prior 
to making any such revision, the Secretary shall provide notice of 
the proposed change in the boundary to the Committee on Interior 
and Insular Affairs of the House of Representatives and the 
Committee on Energy and Natural Resources and Select Committee 
on Indian Affairs of the Senate. No such revision shall take effect 
sooner than 60 days after such notice has been provided to such 
Committees. After the effective date of any such revision, the 
Secretary shall prepare a revised map of the park, copies of which 
shall be provided to such Committees. 
 
SEC. 4. MANAGEMENT. 
 
 (a) PURPOSES.—(1) The Secretary, acting through the Director of 
the National Park Service, and in consultation with the Advisory 
Commission established pursuant to section 6 of this Act, shall 
manage the lands covered by any leasehold accepted by the 
Secretary pursuant to section 3 as a unit of the National Park 
System consistent with the provisions of this Act, and the Act of 
August 25, 1916 (39 Stat. 535; 16 U.S.C. 1 et seq.), as amended and 
supplemented, and the Act of August 21, 1935 (49 Stat. 666; 16 
U.S.C. 461), as amended. 
 (2) The Secretary shall protect, manage, and administer the park 
for the purposes of preserving the historical, archeological, natural, 
scientific, cultural, and other resources and values of the park and 
providing for the public understanding and enjoyment of the same 
in such a manner as to perpetuate these resources and values for 
future generations. 
 (3) In implementing this Act, the Secretary shall cooperate with 
the Zuni Tribe. 
 (b) JURISDICTION.—The Secretary is authorized to accept 
concurrent jurisdiction from the Zuni Tribe for the purpose of law 
enforcement. 
 (c) CONSULTATION.—The Secretary, acting through the Director 
of the National Park Service, shall consult regularly with the 
Commission established pursuant to section 6 of this Act. The 
Commission shall advise the Secretary on the management and 
operation of the park. 
 (d) FEES.—All enrolled members of the Zuni Tribe shall be 
exempt from the payment of fees for admission into the park. 
 (e) TRAINING.—In furtherance of the purposes specified in 
subsection (a)(2), and after consultation with the Advisory 
Commission established by section 6, the Secretary is authorized to 
enter into cooperative agreements with the Zuni Tribe, its 
subordinate boards, committees and enterprises, and individual 
members of the Zuni Tribe for the purpose of providing training of 
Zuni tribal members 
 

 



492 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS  
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 493  
 

PUBLIC LAW 100–567—OCT. 31, 1988 102 STAT. 2849 
 
on the interpretation, management, protection, and preservation of 
archaeological and historical properties and in the provision of 
public services on the Zuni Indian Reservation needed for the 
fulfillment of the purposes specified in subsection (a)(2). 
 (f) PREFERENCE.—To the extent feasible, the Secretary shall 
exercise existing authorities so as to give preference to employing 
qualified members of the Zuni Tribe in the development, 
interpretation, and management of the park and in carrying out 
other activities related to the park. 
 
SEC. 5. FEDERAL CONSISTENCY. 
 
 (a) FEDERAL ACTIONS.—The head of any Federal agency 
conducting or supporting activities directly or indirectly affecting 
the park shall— 

(1) consult with, cooperate with, and, to the maximum extent 
practicable, coordinate its activities with the Secretary and 
with the Advisory Commission; and 

(2) conduct or support such activities in a manner which— 
 (A) to the maximum extent practicable is consistent with 
the standards and criteria established pursuant to the plan 
required in section 7 of this Act, and 
 (B) will not have a significant adverse effect on the 
resources or values of the park, as determined by the 
Secretary. 

 (b) PERMITS.—No Federal agency may issue any license or permit 
to any person to conduct any activity within the park or which could 
affect the resources or values of the park unless the Secretary 
determines that any such proposed activity within the park will be 
conducted in a manner consistent with the standards and criteria 
established pursuant to the plan required in section 7 of this Act 
and wherever occurring will not have a significant adverse effect on 
the resources or values of the park. 
 (c) LIMITATION.—The provisions of this section shall apply only 
with respect to activities begun and licenses or permits issued after 
the date of enactment of this Act. 
 
SEC. 6. ESTABLISHMENT OF ZUNI-CIBOLA ADVISORY COMMISSION. 
 
 (a) ESTABLISHMENT.—(1) There is established within the 
Department of the Interior a commission to be known as the Zuni-
Cibola National Historical Park Advisory Commission which shall 
advise regularly the Director of the National Park Service on the 
planning, management, and administration of the park. The 
Advisory Commission shall consist of the Governor of the Zuni 
Tribe, the Director of the National Park Service, the Secretary of 
the Smithsonian Institution, the State Historic Preservation Officer 
of New Mexico (or their designees), and three members appointed 
by the Secretary from recommendations made by the Governor of 
the Zuni Tribe. 
 (2) The Advisory Commission is authorized to employ an 
administrative director who shall be appointed by the Advisory 
Commission and who shall be paid at a rate not to exceed the rate of 
pay payable for grade GS–12 of the General Schedule. 
 (3) The administrative director of the Advisory Commission may 
be appointed without regard to the provisions of title 5, United 
States Code, governing appointments in the competitive service, 
and may be paid without regard to the provisions of chapter 51, and 
subchapter  III   of   chapter 53   of such title relating to 
classification 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410pp–3. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410pp–4. 

 



494 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS  
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 495  
 
102 STAT. 2850 PUBLIC LAW 100–567—OCT. 31, 1988 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Public 
information. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410pp–5. 
 
 

and General Schedule pay rates, except that the individual so 
appointed may not receive pay in excess of the annual rate of basic 
pay payable for grade GS–12 of the General Schedule. 
 (4) The Administrator of the General Services Administration 
shall provide to the Advisory Commission on a reimbursable basis 
such administrative support services as the Advisory Commission 
may request. 
 (b) TERMS.—The initial terms of members of the Advisory 
Commission appointed by the Secretary pursuant to subsection (a) 
shall be staggered, as determined by the Secretary, in order to 
assure continuity in the administration of the Advisory 
Commission. Thereafter the term shall be four years. Any member 
of the Advisory Commission appointed for a definite term may serve 
after the expiration of such member’s term until a successor is 
appointed. A vacancy in the Advisory Commission shall be filled in 
the manner in which the original appointment was made. The 
advisory Commission shall exist for the duration of a leasehold 
accepted by the Secretary pursuant to section 3, and any extensions 
or renewals thereof. 
 (c) EXPENSES.—The non-Federal members of the Advisory 
Commission appointed pursuant to subsection (a) while away from 
their homes or regular places of business in the performance of 
services for the Advisory Commission, shall be allowed travel and 
all other related expenses, including per diem in lieu of subsistence, 
in the same manner as persons employed intermittently in 
Government service are allowed expenses under section 5703 of title 
5 of the United States Code. 
 (d) CHAIR.—The Governor of the Zuni Tribe shall be the Chair of 
the Advisory Commission. Other officers of the Advisory 
Commission shall be elected by a majority of the members of the 
Advisory Commission to serve for terms established by the Advisory 
Commission. 
 (e) MEETINGS.—The Advisory Commission shall meet at the call 
of the Chair or a majority of its members. Consistent with the 
public meeting requirements of the Federal Advisory Committee 
Act, the Advisory Commission shall from time to time meet with 
persons concerned with park issues relating to the Zuni Tribe. 
 (f) APPLICATION OF FEDERAL ADVISORY COMMITTEE ACT.—Except 
with respect to any requirement for reissuance of a charter and 
except as otherwise provided in this Act, the provisions of the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act shall apply to the Advisory 
Commission established by this section. 
 
SEC. 7. PARK PLAN. 
 
 (a) DEADLINE.—No later than 3 years after the date of the 
publication of a notice pursuant to section 3(a), the Secretary, acting 
through the Director of the National Park Service and in 
consultation with the Advisory Commission, shall develop and 
transmit to the Committee on Interior and Insular Affairs of the 
House of Representatives and the Committee on Energy and 
Natural Resources and the Select Committee on Indian Affairs of 
the Senate, a general management plan for the park which shall 
describe the appropriate uses and development of the park 
consistent with the purposes of this Act. 
 (b) ELEMENTS.—The park plan shall include (but not be limited 
to) the following: 
 

 
 



496 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS  
 

PUBLIC LAW 100–567—OCT. 31, 1988 102 STAT. 2851 
 

(1) Plans for implementation of a continuing program of 
interpretation and visitor education about the resources and 
values of the park. 

(2) Proposals for visitor use facilities to be developed for the 
park. 

(3) Plans for management of the natural and cultural 
resources of the park in order to carry out the purposes 
specified in section 4(a)(2) of this Act, with particular emphasis 
on the preservation and long-term scientific use of archeological 
resources, giving high priority to the enforcement of the 
provisions of the Archeological Resources Protection Act of 1979 
(16 U.S.C. 470aa et seq.) and the National Historic Preservation 
Act (16 U.S.C. 470 et seq.) within the park. The natural and 
cultural resources management plans shall be prepared in close 
consultation with the New Mexico State Historic Preservation 
Office and the Zuni Tribe and their traditional cultural and 
religious authorities. 

(4) Proposals for training members of the Zuni Tribe in such 
fields as interpretation, management, and artifact curation. 

(5) A plan to implement the provisions of section 8 of this Act 
so as to ensure the protection of the right of the Zuni people to 
practice traditional Zuni religious activities within the park 
boundaries in a manner consistent with the purpose and intent 
of the American Indian Religious Freedom Act of August 11, 
1978 (42 U.S.C. 1996). 

(6) Proposals for cooperative research and interpretive 
programs within the park to be carried out by the Zuni Tribe 
through its archeology program, with technical assistance from 
the National Park Service. 

(7) Proposals for implementing the provisions of this Act 
relating to the operation and supply of park concessions by 
qualified Zuni-owned businesses. 

 
SEC. 8. CULTURAL AND RELIGIOUS USES. 
 
 In furtherance of the American Indian Religious Freedom Act, 
the Secretary, upon the request of an appropriate official of the Zuni 
Tribe, may, from time to time, temporarily close to general public 
use one or more specific portions of the park in order to protect the 
privacy of religious activities in such areas by Indian people. Any 
such closure shall be made so as to affect the smallest practicable 
area for the minimum period necessary for such purposes. Not later 
than 7 days after the first day on which any such closure takes 
effect, the Secretary shall provide written notification of such action 
to the Energy and Natural Resources Committee and Select 
Committee on Indian Affairs of the United States Senate and the 
Committee on Interior and Insular Affairs of the House of 
Representatives. 
 
SEC. 9. DEFINITIONS. 
 
 As used in this Act— 

(1) the term “Advisory Commission” means the Zuni-Cibola 
National Historical Park Advisory Commission established 
under section 6; 

(2) the term “Park” means lands constituting a Zuni-Cibola 
National Historical Park established under section 2; 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410pp–6. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410pp–7. 
 

 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 497  
 
102 STAT. 2852 PUBLIC LAW 100–567—OCT. 31, 1988 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 
460uu–12. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410pp–8. 
 

(3) the term “park plan” means the general management plan 
developed pursuant to section 7; and 

(4) the term “Secretary” means the Secretary of the Interior. 
 

SEC. 10. ADDITION TO MASAU TRAIL. 
 
 The first sentence of section 202 of the Act of December 31, 1987 
(Public Law 100–225; 101 Stat. 1540) is amended by striking out 
“and Gila Cliff Dwelling National Monument.” and inserting in lieu 
thereof “Gila Cliff Dwellings National Monument, and Zuni-Cibola 
National Historical Park.”. 
 
SEC. 11. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS. 
 
 There are authorized to be appropriated such sums as may be 
necessary for the purposes of this Act. 
 
 Approved October 31, 1988. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—H.R. 4182 (S. 2162): 

HOUSE REPORTS: No. 100–942 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
SENATE REPORTS: No. 100–354 accompanying S. 2162 (Select Comm. on   
          Indian Affairs). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 134 (1988): 

Sept. 20, considered and passed House. S. 2162 considered and passed 
         Senate. 
Oct. 11, H.R. 4182 considered and passed Senate, amended. 
Oct. 12, House concurred in Senate amendment. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



498 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS  
 
 

PUBLIC LAW 101–313—JUNE 27, 1990 104 STAT. 272 
 
Public Law 101–313 
101st Congress 

An Act 
 

 

June 27, 1990 To establish Petroglyph National Monument and Pecos National Historical Park in 
the State of New Mexico, and for other purposes. [S. 286] 

 
 Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the 
United States of America in Congress assembled, 
 

*            *            *            *            *            *            * 
 
TITLE III—ZUNI-CIBOLA NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARK AND 

JUAN DE ONATE MEMORIAL 
 
 SEC. 301. The first sentence of section 202 of Public Law 100–225 
(16 U.S.C. 460uu–12) is amended by deleting “and Zuni-Cibola 
National Historical Park” and inserting “Zuni-Cibola National 
Historical Park, and Petroglyph National Monument”. 
 SEC. 302. The Zuni-Cibola National Historical Park 
Establishment Act of 1988 (16 U.S.C. 410pp et seq.) is amended— 

(1) in section 2(c)— 
 (A) by striking “24 months” and inserting “6 years”; and 
 (B) by striking “24-month” and inserting “6-year”; and 

(2) in section 3(a) by striking “18 months” and inserting “5½ 
years”. 

 SEC. 303. (a) The tract of land described in subsection (b) shall be 
treated as public land for the purposes of the Act of June 14, 1926 
(43 U.S.C. 869 et seq.; commonly known as the “Recreation and 
Public Purposes Act”). 
 (b) The land referred to in paragraph (1) is approximately 5 acres 
of the Sebastian Martin Land Grant near Los Luceros, New Mexico, 
as generally depicted on the map entitled “Onate Memorial Map” 
and dated July 1989. 
 
   Approved June 27, 1990. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
LEGISLATIVE HISTORY—S. 286: 
HOUSE REPORTS. No. 101–491 (Comm. on Interior and Insular Affairs). 
SEINATE REPORTS: No. 101–230 (Comm. on Energy and Natural Resources). 
CONGRESSIONAL RECORD, Vol. 136 (1990): 

Jan. 24, considered and passed Senate. 
May 21, 22, considered and passed House, amended. 
June 12, Senate concurred in House amendments with amendments. 
June 14, House concurred in Senate amendments. 

WEEKLY COMPILATION OF PRESIDENTIAL DOCUMENTS, Vol. 26 (1990): 
  June 27, Presidential statement. 
 
 
 

 
Public lands.  
 
 
 
 
104 STAT. 279 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
16 USC 410pp. 
 
 
 
16 USC 410pp–1.  
 
 
104 STAT. 280 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 



 NATIONAL HISTORICAL PARKS 499  
 
 
 


